
[[8-348419]] VOLVO EC480E 310415 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP353491
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: 8-348419

GERDAU AMERISTEEL1 GERDAU COURTWHITBY, ONCA  L1N 5T1Contact: Tyson Youngtyoung@gerdauameristeel.comT: (905)668-8811F: (905)668-6469
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition. Please specifythe brand, type, and viscosity of theoil on your next sample.Chromiumand iron ppm levels are abnormal.The low ferrous density (PQ) indexindicates the wear metal levels aredue to corrosion. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The oil is no longerserviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: LAKWHIUnique No: 5503702Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 29 Dec 2022
Report Id: LAKWHI [WCAMIS] 02530704 (Generated: 08/23/2023 15:56:00) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Tyson Young - LAKWHI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP353491 VCP298401 VCP232936 ---Sample Date 14 Dec 2022 10 Aug 2021 19 Nov 2019 ---Machine Hours 6005 3998 1980 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 79.7 178 249 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 340 517 103 ---Sodium ppm 24 32 9 ---Potassium ppm 23 35 6 ---
 WEAR METALSPQ 492 999 --- ---Iron ppm 3553 2707 569 ---Copper ppm 9 7 2 ---Lead ppm 5 8 1 ---Tin ppm <1 0 0 ---Aluminum ppm 86 126 23 ---Chromium ppm 31 30 10 ---Molybdenum ppm 3 2 <1 ---Nickel ppm 2 1 <1 ---Titanium ppm 8 11 2 ---Silver ppm 0 <1 0 ---Manganese ppm 40 48 11 ---Vanadium ppm <1 1 <1 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 665 940 452 ---Magnesium ppm 57 84 24 ---Zinc ppm 75 98 168 ---Phosphorus ppm 1825 961 747 ---Barium ppm 0 4 2 ---Boron ppm 149 129 64 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: LAKWHI [WCAMIS] 02530704 (Generated: 08/23/2023 15:56:03) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Tyson Young - LAKWHI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480E 310415\Rear Right Final Drive [VCP353491] 14 Dec 2022 @ 6005.0 hrs

