
[[356022]] VOLVO A25G 742129 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP352743
Oil Type: MOBIL 15W40
Job No: 356022

Duroking construction100-12075 Rue Arthur SicardMirabel, QCCA  J7J 0E9Contact: Service Manager
T: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: DURMIRUnique No: 5538285Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 24 Feb 2023
Report Id: DURMIR [WCAMIS] 02541280 (Generated: 09/28/2023 15:31:35) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - DURMIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP352743 --- --- ---Sample Date 17 Feb 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 9357 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.6 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 68 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 65 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 61 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 3 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 7 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 7 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2082 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 94 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1107 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1032 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 102 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: DURMIR [WCAMIS] 02541280 (Generated: 09/28/2023 15:31:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - DURMIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25G 742129\Diesel Engine [VCP352743] 17 Feb 2023 @ 9357.0 hrs

