
[[357394]] VOLVO L50HS 4422254 - REFERENCE NEW (UNUSED) OIL

Sample No: VCP352921
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT VCS (YELLOW)
Job No: 357394

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT-EDMONTON25616 117 Ave NWAcheson, ABCA  T7X 6C2Contact: Jonathan Mortonjmorton@strongco.comT: (780)464-1909F: (780)464-0434
Diagnosis
This is the baseline readout on thisnew (unused) oil. The fluid is suitablefor service.{not applicable} There isno indication of any contamination inthe new (unused) oil. The conditionof the oil is suitable for service.

Depot: VOLVO3908Unique No: 5540618Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 13 Mar 2023
Report Id: VOLVO3908 [WCAMIS] 02543613 (Generated: 09/28/2023 10:45:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jonathan Morton - VOLVO3908

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP352921 --- --- ---Sample Date 02 Mar 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1112 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 1 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3071 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 23 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 1 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 14 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 2 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 4 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 5 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 30 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO3908 [WCAMIS] 02543613 (Generated: 09/28/2023 10:45:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jonathan Morton - VOLVO3908
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L50HS 4422254\Reference New (Unused) Oil [VCP352921] 02 Mar 2023 @ 1112.0 hrs

