
[TAHLTAN BAND [W09003335-1]] 210752 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP324518
Oil Type: KLONDIKE HEAVY DUTY 15W40
Job No: W09003335-1

Great West Equipment3830 Sharples RoadTerrace, BCCA  V8G 5P8Contact: Justin Waitejwaite@gwequipment.comT: (250)635-9033F: (250)638-1895
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Confirmthe source of the lubricant beingutilized for top-up/fill. Resample atthe next service interval to monitor.No other corrective action isrecommended at this time. The fluidwas specified as KLONDIKE HEAVYDUTY 15W40, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is SAE 30Diesel Engine Oil.  Please confirm theoil type and grade on your nextsample.All component wear rates arenormal. Light fuel dilution occurring.No other contaminants weredetected in the oil. Viscosity ofsample indicates oil is within SAE 30range, advise investigate. This plusthe additive levels indicates that thisis not the same brand, or type of oilas reported. The condition of the oilis acceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0284Unique No: 5554890Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 06 Apr 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0284 [WCAMIS] 02549880 (Generated: 09/08/2023 17:07:39) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Justin Waite - VOLVO0284

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP324518 --- --- ---Sample Date 31 Mar 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 5096 --- --- ---Oil Hours 200 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.3 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 61 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 64 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 60 --- --- ---Glycol % 0.0 --- --- ---Fuel % 1.2 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 7 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 38 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 13 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 25 --- --- ---Copper ppm 6 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 6 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 64 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1195 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 1038 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1292 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1195 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 3 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0284 [WCAMIS] 02549880 (Generated: 09/08/2023 17:07:41) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Justin Waite - VOLVO0284
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO 210752\Diesel Engine [VCP324518] 31 Mar 2023 @ 5096.0 hrs

