
[[360040]] VOLVO L70H 622160 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP353246
Oil Type: VOLVO WET BRAKE TRANSAXLE OIL
Job No: 360040

STRONGCO EQUIP (AB)6 - 38403 BURNT LAKE TRAILRED DEER COUNTY, ABCA  T4S 2L4Contact: Perry Doylepdoyle@strongco.comT: (403)391-3520F: (403)346-3487
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition. Please notethat this is a corrected copy for dataentry updates.Iron ppm levels areabnormal. The low ferrous density(PQ) index indicates the wear metallevels are due to corrosion. There isno indication of any contamination inthe oil. The oil is no longerserviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: VOLVO9652Unique No: 5555705Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 04 Jan 2024
Report Id: VOLVO9652 [WCAMIS] 02550695 (Generated: 01/04/2024 16:41:16) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: Perry Doyle - VOLVO9652

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP353246 VCP280586 VCP213479 ---Sample Date 06 Apr 2023 18 Aug 2021 22 Mar 2019 ---Machine Hours 6501 4205 2110 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 49.1 48.1 50.1 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Silicon ppm 32 12 12 ---Sodium ppm 9 4 <1 ---Potassium ppm 2 <1 <1 ---
 WEAR METALSPQ 210 --- --- ---Iron ppm 526 181 265 ---Copper ppm 16 8 27 ---Lead ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Tin ppm 2 <1 3 ---Aluminum ppm 4 <1 <1 ---Chromium ppm 3 <1 2 ---Molybdenum ppm 6 1 4 ---Nickel ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Titanium ppm <1 0 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 5 2 4 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 4151 3429 3699 ---Magnesium ppm 21 11 11 ---Zinc ppm 1486 1385 1459 ---Phosphorus ppm 1258 1246 1190 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 115 100 106 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO9652 [WCAMIS] 02550695 (Generated: 01/04/2024 16:41:19) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: Perry Doyle - VOLVO9652
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L70H 622160\Rear Axle [VCP353246] 06 Apr 2023 @ 6501.0 hrs

