
[[365439]] VOLVO L120H 632067 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP380879
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: 365439

STRONGCO EQUIP (AB)6 - 38403 BURNT LAKE TRAILRED DEER COUNTY, ABCA  T4S 2L4Contact: Perry Doylepdoyle@strongco.comT: (403)346-3473F: (403)346-3487
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.All componentwear rates are normal. There is amoderate amount of particulates (2to 100 microns in size) present in theoil. The oil is still serviceable providedthat the contaminant(s) can bereduced to acceptable levels.

Depot: VOLVO9652Unique No: 5580878Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 29 May 2023
Report Id: VOLVO9652 [WCAMIS] 02559838 (Generated: 07/31/2023 13:01:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Perry Doyle - VOLVO9652

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP380879 VCP332778 VCP334133 VCP275204Sample Date 24 May 2023 04 May 2022 14 Feb 2022 06 Apr 2021Machine Hours 25175 21283 19715 15936Oil Hours 4000 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 41.5 41.6 41.5 41.2
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 7583 15355 59770 2504Particles >6µm 2242 3367 13863 686Particles >14µm 271 173 461 53ISO 4406:1999 (c) 20/18/15 21/19/15 23/21/16 19/17/13Silicon ppm 7 8 13 8Sodium ppm 1 <1 <1 2Potassium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 6 4 6 6Copper ppm 1 <1 2 1Lead ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Tin ppm 0 <1 <1 0Aluminum ppm <1 <1 1 2Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 0 0 0 0Nickel ppm <1 <1 0 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm 0 0 0 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 68 56 58 64Magnesium ppm <1 <1 <1 1Zinc ppm 418 443 433 442Phosphorus ppm 364 371 353 330Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm <1 <1 <1 <1

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO9652 [WCAMIS] 02559838 (Generated: 07/31/2023 13:01:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Perry Doyle - VOLVO9652
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L120H 632067\Hydraulic System [VCP380879] 24 May 2023 @ 25175.0 hrs

