
VOLVO L250G 3128 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP82325
Oil Type: VOLVO AT 102
Job No:

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT-EDMONTON25616 117 Ave NWAcheson, ABCA  T7X 6C2Contact: Jesse Patenaudejpatenaude@strongco.comT: (780)948-3515F: (780)417-2615
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for visiblemetal particles in the fluid. Werecommend that you drain the fluidfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We recommendan early resample to monitor thiscondition.Light concentration ofvisible metal present. Gear wear isindicated. The water content isnegligible. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fluid. Thefluid is no longer serviceable as aresult of the abnormal and/or severewear.

Depot: VOLVO3908Unique No: 5592283Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 14 Jun 2023
Report Id: VOLVO3908 [WCAMIS] 02563242 (Generated: 09/28/2023 10:09:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jesse Patenaude - VOLVO3908

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP82325 --- --- ---Sample Date 01 Jun 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 18696 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 29.2 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.035 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 11 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 36 --- --- ---Copper ppm 11 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 29 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 33 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm <1 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 7 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 203 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 81 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO3908 [WCAMIS] 02563242 (Generated: 09/28/2023 10:09:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jesse Patenaude - VOLVO3908
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L250G 3128\Transmission (Auto) [VCP82325] 01 Jun 2023 @ 18696.0 hrs

