
[CBM [368488]] VOLVO L220H 3261 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP392234
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: 368488

Strongco Equipment5179 Fountain St N.Breslau, ONCA  N0B 1M0Contact: Nick Sandersnsanders@strongco.comT: (519)744-3518F: (519)744-3284
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. The system cleanliness isacceptable for your target ISO 4406cleanliness code. The system andfluid cleanliness is acceptable.Viscosity of sample indicates oil iswithin ISO 15 range, adviseinvestigate. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: CASKITUnique No: 5604013Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 29 Jun 2023
Report Id: CASKIT [WCAMIS] 02566967 (Generated: 09/21/2023 14:54:39) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Nick Sanders - CASKIT

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP392234 --- --- ---Sample Date 22 Jun 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3435 --- --- ---Oil Hours 437 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 17.6 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 235 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 46 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 7 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 15/13/10 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 4 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 13 --- --- ---Copper ppm 7 --- --- ---Lead ppm 1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 3 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 41 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 2 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 405 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 357 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm <1 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CASKIT [WCAMIS] 02566967 (Generated: 09/21/2023 14:54:42) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Nick Sanders - CASKIT
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L220H 3261\Hydraulic System [VCP392234] 22 Jun 2023 @ 3435.0 hrs

