
[[366880]] 27-4553 - FRONT LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP394948
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: 366880

CRH CANADA GROUP INC.P.O. BOX 5400CONCORD, ONCA  L4K 1B6Contact: Dan Browndan.brown@ca.crh.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Theoil change at the time of samplinghas been noted. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition.Iron ppm levels areabnormal. Aluminum ppm levels arenoted. The low ferrous density (PQ)index indicates the wear metal levelsare due to corrosion. Elemental levelsof silicon (Si) and aluminum (Al)indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt)ingress. High amount of ingresseddirt has caused abrasive wear to thecomponent. The oil is no longerserviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: HOLCONUnique No: 5604058Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 29 Jun 2023
Report Id: HOLCON [WCAMIS] 02567012 (Generated: 06/30/2023 07:59:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Dan Brown - HOLCON

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP394948 VCP352367 --- ---Sample Date 09 Jun 2023 11 Aug 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 2034 481 --- ---Oil Hours 2000 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 127 180 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 161 8 --- ---Sodium ppm 11 <1 --- ---Potassium ppm 12 <1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSPQ 24 --- --- ---Iron ppm 781 242 --- ---Copper ppm 4 <1 --- ---Lead ppm <1 0 --- ---Tin ppm 0 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 36 <1 --- ---Chromium ppm 10 3 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 2 0 --- ---Silver ppm <1 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 9 3 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 114 12 --- ---Magnesium ppm 15 2 --- ---Zinc ppm 73 7 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 728 197 --- ---Barium ppm 2 1 --- ---Boron ppm 77 1 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: HOLCON [WCAMIS] 02567012 (Generated: 06/30/2023 07:59:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Dan Brown - HOLCON
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO 27-4553\Front Left Final Drive [VCP394948] 09 Jun 2023 @ 2034.0 hrs

