
[[367108]] 27-4551 - RIGHT SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP394978
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90
Job No: 367108

CRH CANADA GROUP INC.P.O. BOX 5400CONCORD, ONCA  L4K 1B6Contact: Dan Browndan.brown@ca.crh.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Werecommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We recommendan early resample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a moderateconcentration of water present in theoil. The oil is no longer serviceabledue to the presence of contaminants.

Depot: HOLCONUnique No: 5604062Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 29 Jun 2023
Report Id: HOLCON [WCAMIS] 02567016 (Generated: 06/30/2023 07:59:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Dan Brown - HOLCON

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP394978 VCP224344 VCP280655 VCP246908Sample Date 17 Jun 2023 08 Jun 2022 04 Feb 2021 30 Sep 2019Machine Hours 8024 6035 3965 2134Oil Hours 4000 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 131 61.7 144 189
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.261 --- 0.206 0.487Silicon ppm 6 19 9 15Sodium ppm <1 2 1 0Potassium ppm <1 <1 <1 1
 WEAR METALSPQ --- 0 --- ---Iron ppm 167 2366 842 837Copper ppm 13 247 41 25Lead ppm <1 8 2 <1Tin ppm 0 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 2 4 1 2Chromium ppm 2 19 8 9Molybdenum ppm <1 1 <1 <1Nickel ppm <1 0 <1 0Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 <1 0Manganese ppm 4 18 7 10Vanadium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 182 9 14 15Magnesium ppm 5 3 <1 2Zinc ppm 106 127 44 37Phosphorus ppm 1066 1955 913 392Barium ppm 0 0 0 1Boron ppm 125 159 57 2

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: HOLCON [WCAMIS] 02567016 (Generated: 06/30/2023 07:59:41) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Dan Brown - HOLCON
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO 27-4551\Right Swing Drive [VCP394978] 17 Jun 2023 @ 8024.0 hrs

