
[[370676]] VOLVO ECR145D 210093 - FRONT RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP391769
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: 370676

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT INC.72 CHEMIN DU TREMBLAYBOUCHERVILLE, QCCA  J4B 6Z6Contact: Jonathan Lamontagnejlamontagne@strongco.comT: (450)449-4666F: (450)449-7913
Diagnosis
Confirm the source of the lubricantbeing utilized for top-up/fill.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Additivelevels indicate the addition of adifferent brand, or type of oil.Viscosity of sample indicates oil iswithin SAE 75W90 range, adviseinvestigate. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: SHEBOUUnique No: 5607231Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 19 Jul 2023
Report Id: SHEBOU [WCAMIS] 02570185 (Generated: 07/19/2023 09:55:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jonathan Lamontagne - SHEBOU

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP391769 --- --- ---Sample Date 29 Jun 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 9909 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 97.5 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 278 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 12 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 15 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSPQ 50 --- --- ---Iron ppm 1407 --- --- ---Copper ppm 3 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 20 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 46 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 14 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 23 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 4 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 9 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 353 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 271 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 451 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1007 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 105 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHEBOU [WCAMIS] 02570185 (Generated: 07/19/2023 09:55:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jonathan Lamontagne - SHEBOU
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR145D 210093\Front Right Final Drive [VCP391769] 29 Jun 2023 @ 9909.0 hrs

