
316243 - FRONT RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP394924
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No:

GREAT WEST EQUIPMENT1600 KOSMINA ROAD, 123 L&A CROSS RDVERNON, BCCA  V1T 8T2Contact: Sarah Lawrenceslawrence@gwequipment.comT: (866)627-2357F: (250)549-3397
Diagnosis
We recommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. Confirm thesource of the lubricant being utilizedfor top-up/fill. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition.Tin ppm levels areabnormal. Light concentration ofvisible metal present. Bearing and/orbushing wear is indicated. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. Additive levels indicate theaddition of a different brand, or typeof oil. The oil is no longer serviceableas a result of the abnormal and/orsevere wear.

Depot: MARVERUnique No: 5607475Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 19 Jul 2023
Report Id: MARVER [WCAMIS] 02570429 (Generated: 07/19/2023 08:39:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Sarah Lawrence - MARVER

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP394924 --- --- ---Sample Date 16 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 500 --- --- ---Oil Hours 500 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 136 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 68 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 10 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 6 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 435 --- --- ---Copper ppm 1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 31 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 15 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 9 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 8 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 39 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 4 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 31 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 389 --- --- ---Barium ppm 2 --- --- ---Boron ppm 1 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: MARVER [WCAMIS] 02570429 (Generated: 07/19/2023 08:39:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Sarah Lawrence - MARVER
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO 316243\Front Right Final Drive [VCP394924] 16 Jul 2023 @ 500.0 hrs

