
31694 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP428158
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No:

GREAT WEST EQUIPMENT1600 KOSMINA ROAD, 123 L&A CROSS RDVERNON, BCCA  V1T 8T2Contact: Garry Beachgbeach@gwequipment.comT: (250)549-4232F: (250)549-3397
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for visiblemetal particles in the oil. The oilchange at the time of sampling hasbeen noted. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor this condition.The fluid was not specified, however,a fluid match indicates that this fluidis SAE 10W Transmission/Drive TrainOil.  Please confirm the oil type andgrade, and specify the brand of theoil on your next sample. Moderateconcentration of visible metalpresent. Gear wear is indicated. Thereis no indication of any contaminationin the oil. The oil is no longerserviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: MARVERUnique No: 5607476Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 19 Jul 2023
Report Id: MARVER [WCAMIS] 02570430 (Generated: 07/19/2023 08:38:25) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Garry Beach - MARVER

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP428158 --- --- ---Sample Date 16 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 9524 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 36.9 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 4 --- --- ---Sodium ppm <1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 106 --- --- ---Copper ppm 3 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2957 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 18 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1238 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1252 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 11 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: MARVER [WCAMIS] 02570430 (Generated: 07/19/2023 08:38:28) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Garry Beach - MARVER
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO 31694\Front Axle [VCP428158] 16 Jul 2023 @ 9524.0 hrs

