
[MOGGIE VALLEY [8-370841]] ECO LOG 590F 111 - SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP273525
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: 8-370841

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT INC.1640 ENTERPRISE ROADMISSISSAUGA, ONCA  L4W 4L4Contact: Jason RothJRoth2@strongco.comT: (905)670-5100F: (905)670-2338
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. The fluid was notspecified, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is SAE 75W90Gear Oil.  Please confirm the oil typeand grade, and specify the brand ofthe oil on your next sample.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: SHEMISUnique No: 5616546Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 21 Jul 2023
Report Id: SHEMIS [WCAMIS] 02571495 (Generated: 07/21/2023 15:07:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jason Roth - SHEMIS

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP273525 --- --- ---Sample Date 20 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 350 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 97.5 --- --- ---Visc @ 100°C cSt 15.2 --- --- ---Viscosity Index (VI) Scale 164 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 4 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 14 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 58 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 3 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 30 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 2 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 105 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 2171 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 3 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHEMIS [WCAMIS] 02571495 (Generated: 07/21/2023 15:07:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jason Roth - SHEMIS
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	ECO LOG ECO LOG 590F 111\Swing Drive [VCP273525] 20 Jul 2023 @ 350.0 hrs

