
NO UNIT VCP353447 - UNKNOWN COMPONENT

Sample No: VCP353447
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No:

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT (CE)1051 Heritage Rd.Burlington, ONCA  L7L 4Y1Contact: C. Carterccarter@strongco.comT: F: (905)643-6077
Diagnosis
Little or no information is provided asto the component and lubricantbeing tested.  Recommendations aretherefore generic in nature and maynot apply to the current application.Please forward information as toequipment type, reservoir capacity,lubricant type and any pertinentinformation to allow for a moreaccurate assessment. We advise thatyou check for visible metal particlesin the sample. We recommend thatyou drain the sample from thecomponent if this has not alreadybeen done. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor this condition.Please provide more completeinformation on your next sample.Theiron level is abnormal. Highconcentration of visible metalpresent. Insufficient sample wasreceived to conduct all the routinelaboratory tests. The sample is nolonger serviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: VOLVO0252Unique No: 5616645Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 24 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0252 [WCAMIS] 02571594 (Generated: 07/24/2023 16:04:44) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: C. Carter - VOLVO0252

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP353447 --- --- ---Sample Date 20 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 119 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 47 --- --- ---Sodium ppm <1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 1224 --- --- ---Copper ppm 4 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 5 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 8 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 9 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 39 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 12 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 25 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 633 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 11 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0252 [WCAMIS] 02571594 (Generated: 07/24/2023 16:04:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: C. Carter - VOLVO0252
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	NO UNIT VCP353447\Unknown Component [VCP353447] 20 Jul 2023 @ .0 hrs

