
[BERGEN [8000372864]] VOLVO L60H 622360 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCE07567
Oil Type: VOLVO EXTRA AUTOMATIC FLUID
Job No: 8000372864

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT255 BAIG BOULEVARDMONCTON, NBCA  E1E 1E1Contact: Kevin Pentkpent@strongco.comT: (506)857-8425F: (506)857-0851
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: SHE255MONUnique No: 5617758Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 01 Aug 2023
Report Id: SHE255MON [WCAMIS] 02572707 (Generated: 08/01/2023 06:54:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Kevin Pent - SHE255MON

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCE07567 --- --- ---Sample Date 17 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 4633 --- --- ---Oil Hours 500 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 27.8 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 6 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 41 --- --- ---Copper ppm 4 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 4 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 126 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 8 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 65 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 246 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 75 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHE255MON [WCAMIS] 02572707 (Generated: 08/01/2023 06:54:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Kevin Pent - SHE255MON
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L60H 622360\Transmission (Auto) [VCE07567] 17 Jul 2023 @ 4633.0 hrs

