
[[8002963]] 341063 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP248729
Oil Type: KLONDIKE AW 32
Job No: 8002963

GREAT WEST EQUIPMENTP.O. BOX 6067, 12623 CHARLIE LAKE FRONTAGE RDFORT ST. JOHN, BCCA  V1J 2B0Contact: Mathew Stockleymstockley@gwequipmnet.comT: (250)785-4223F: (250)785-4237
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. The system cleanliness isacceptable for your target ISO 4406cleanliness code. The system andfluid cleanliness is acceptable. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO5076Unique No: 5618031Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 31 Jul 2023
Report Id: VOLVO5076 [WCAMIS] 02572980 (Generated: 07/31/2023 10:34:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Mathew Stockley - VOLVO5076

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP248729 --- --- ---Sample Date 20 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 10120 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 32.6 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 7013 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 514 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 13 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 20/16/11 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 8 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 7 --- --- ---Copper ppm 4 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 46 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 4 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 421 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 366 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm <1 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO5076 [WCAMIS] 02572980 (Generated: 07/31/2023 10:34:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Mathew Stockley - VOLVO5076
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO 341063\Hydraulic System [VCP248729] 20 Jul 2023 @ 10120.0 hrs

