
[ARCHIBALD DRILLING [8000373408]] VOLVO EC480EHR 391004 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP380288
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT VCS (YELLOW)
Job No: 8000373408

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT INC.55 ISNOR DRIVE, BURNSIDE INDUSTRIALPARKDARTMOUTH, NSCA  B3B 1N6Contact: Justin Hennigarjhennigar@strongco.comT: (902)468-5010F: (902)468-2468
Diagnosis
Drain system and refill with 50/50premix of manufacturerrecommended coolant.All metallevels are normal indicating nocorrosion in the cooling system.Hardness is elevated. Elevatedhardness can allow scale formationthat will reduce cooling systemeffectiveness. There is no indicationof any contamination in the coolant.The nitrites levels are too high whichleads to additive drop-out and scaleformation. The reserve alkalinity ofthis fluid is higher than acceptableindicating the coolant is over-concentrated. The pH level of thisfluid is within the acceptable limits.

Depot: SHEDARUnique No: 5618945Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 03 Aug 2023
Report Id: SHEDAR [WCAMIS] 02573894 (Generated: 08/03/2023 15:41:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Justin Hennigar - SHEDAR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP380288 --- --- ---Sample Date 06 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 966 --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONBoron ppm 41 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 8 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3228 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 25 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 2 --- --- ---pH Scale 0-14 8.43 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 4.3 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 3 --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 320 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 49.5 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -33 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONMagnesium ppm 2 --- --- ---Calcium ppm 13 --- --- ---Coolant Appearance Clear --- --- ---Coolant Color Yellow --- --- ---Sand/Dirt scalar NONE --- --- ---Debris scalar NONE --- --- ---Precipitate scalar NONE --- --- ---Silt scalar NONE --- --- ---
 CORROSIONIron ppm 1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHEDAR [WCAMIS] 02573894 (Generated: 08/03/2023 15:41:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Justin Hennigar - SHEDAR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480EHR 391004\Coolant [VCP380288] 06 Jul 2023 @ 966.0 hrs

