
[TRIPLE M [373002]] VOLVO EC480E 315055 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP391690
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 373002

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT (CE)1051 Heritage Rd.Burlington, ONCA  L7L 4Y1Contact: C. Carterccarter@strongco.comT: F: (905)643-6077
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Metallevels are typical for a newcomponent breaking in. Fuel contentnegligible. Elevated aluminum (Al)and/or lead (Pb) and potassium (K)levels in your metals analysis arelikely a result of solder flux releaseinto the lubricant and is common onnew equipment/components. Thereis no indication of any contaminationin the oil. Viscosity of sampleindicates oil is within SAE 30 range,advise investigate. The condition ofthe oil is acceptable for the time inservice.

Depot: VOLVO0252Unique No: 5619224Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 08 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0252 [WCAMIS] 02574173 (Generated: 08/08/2023 08:46:28) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: C. Carter - VOLVO0252

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP391690 --- --- ---Sample Date 21 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 664 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 10.4 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 75 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 83 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 62 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 0.9 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 29 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 4 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 4 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 15 --- --- ---Copper ppm 203 --- --- ---Lead ppm 6 --- --- ---Tin ppm 2 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 84 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 3 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2089 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 124 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1162 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1048 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 18 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0252 [WCAMIS] 02574173 (Generated: 08/08/2023 08:46:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: C. Carter - VOLVO0252
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480E 315055\Diesel Engine [VCP391690] 21 Jul 2023 @ 664.0 hrs

