
VOLVO L180F 11722 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP352613
Oil Type: ATF
Job No:

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT-EDMONTON25616 117 Ave NWAcheson, ABCA  T7X 6C2Contact: Jesse Patenaudejpatenaude@strongco.comT: (780)948-3515F: (780)417-2615
Diagnosis
The fluid change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Iron ppmlevels are abnormal. The low ferrousdensity (PQ) index indicates the wearmetal levels are due to corrosion.There is no indication of anycontamination in the fluid. The fluid isno longer serviceable as a result ofthe abnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: VOLVO3908Unique No: 5620465Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 11 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO3908 [WCAMIS] 02575414 (Generated: 08/14/2023 10:36:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jesse Patenaude - VOLVO3908

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP352613 --- --- ---Sample Date 02 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 10490 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 33.4 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 5 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSPQ 36 --- --- ---Iron ppm 213 --- --- ---Copper ppm 3 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 4 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 245 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 3 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 92 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 298 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 32 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO3908 [WCAMIS] 02575414 (Generated: 08/14/2023 10:36:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jesse Patenaude - VOLVO3908
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L180F 11722\Transmission (Auto) [VCP352613] 02 Aug 2023 @ 10490.0 hrs

