
[[371606]] VOLVO A40G 342484 - DROP BOX

Sample No: VCP333624
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER GEAR OIL 75W-80-GO102
Job No: 371606

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT-EDMONTON25616 117 Ave NWAcheson, ABCA  T7X 6C2Contact: Jonathan Mortonjmorton@strongco.comT: (780)464-1909F: (780)464-0434
Diagnosis
Confirm the source of the lubricantbeing utilized for top-up/fill.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Additivelevels indicate the addition of adifferent brand, or type of oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO3908Unique No: 5620477Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 11 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO3908 [WCAMIS] 02575426 (Generated: 08/11/2023 16:43:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jonathan Morton - VOLVO3908

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP333624 VCP298134 --- ---Sample Date 11 Jul 2023 26 Jan 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 9448 8325 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd --- ---Sample Status NORMAL SEVERE --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 52.3 89.8 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 19 13 --- ---Sodium ppm 6 <1 --- ---Potassium ppm 1 <1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSPQ --- 556 --- ---Iron ppm 119 1429 --- ---Copper ppm 7 4 --- ---Lead ppm 0 0 --- ---Tin ppm 0 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 11 --- ---Chromium ppm 2 23 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 11 16 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 12 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 1 13 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 <1 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 94 6 --- ---Magnesium ppm 1 <1 --- ---Zinc ppm 185 14 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 2308 475 --- ---Barium ppm <1 0 --- ---Boron ppm 220 58 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO3908 [WCAMIS] 02575426 (Generated: 08/11/2023 16:43:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jonathan Morton - VOLVO3908
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 342484\Drop Box [VCP333624] 11 Jul 2023 @ 9448.0 hrs

