
[[371606]] VOLVO A40G 342484 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP298136
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: 371606

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT-EDMONTON25616 117 Ave NWAcheson, ABCA  T7X 6C2Contact: Jonathan Mortonjmorton@strongco.comT: (780)464-1909F: (780)464-0434
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. The fluid was notspecified, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is .  Pleaseconfirm the coolant type and grade,and specify the brand of the coolanton your next sample.All componentwear rates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe coolant. The condition of thecoolant is acceptable for the time inservice.

Depot: VOLVO3908Unique No: 5620575Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 11 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO3908 [WCAMIS] 02575524 (Generated: 08/11/2023 16:31:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jonathan Morton - VOLVO3908

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP298136 --- --- ---Sample Date 11 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 9448 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONBoron ppm 306 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 9 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3880 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 401 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 14 --- --- ---pH Scale 0-14 8.31 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 3.2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 112 --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 1200 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 49.9 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -33 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONMagnesium ppm 3 --- --- ---Calcium ppm 16 --- --- ---Coolant Appearance Clear --- --- ---Coolant Color Red --- --- ---Sand/Dirt scalar NONE --- --- ---Debris scalar NONE --- --- ---Precipitate scalar NONE --- --- ---Silt scalar NONE --- --- ---
 CORROSIONIron ppm 2 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Copper ppm 3 --- --- ---Lead ppm 6 --- --- ---Tin ppm 2 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO3908 [WCAMIS] 02575524 (Generated: 08/11/2023 16:31:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jonathan Morton - VOLVO3908
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 342484\Coolant [VCP298136] 11 Jul 2023 @ 9448.0 hrs

