
[[8-374171]] 2547 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP380471
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: 8-374171

CRH CANADA GROUP INC.P.O. BOX 5400CONCORD, ONCA  L4K 1B6Contact: Tim Vissertvisser@strongco.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
We recommend you service the filterson this component. Resample at thenext service interval to monitor.Please specify the brand, type, andviscosity of the oil on your nextsample.All component wear rates arenormal. There is a light amount of silt(particulates < 14 microns in size)present in the oil. The condition ofthe oil is acceptable for the time inservice.

Depot: HOLCONUnique No: 5620780Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 15 Aug 2023
Report Id: HOLCON [WCAMIS] 02575729 (Generated: 08/15/2023 10:37:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Tim Visser - HOLCON

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP380471 --- --- ---Sample Date 11 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 9606 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 40.0 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 17598 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 2987 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 160 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 21/19/14 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 6 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 6 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 13 --- --- ---Copper ppm 6 --- --- ---Lead ppm 1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 4 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 7 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 163 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 112 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 475 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 436 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm <1 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: HOLCON [WCAMIS] 02575729 (Generated: 08/15/2023 10:37:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Tim Visser - HOLCON
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO 2547\Hydraulic System [VCP380471] 11 Aug 2023 @ 9606.0 hrs

