
[WASTE MANAGEMENT [8-375312]] VOLVO EC350EL 314112 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP394510
Oil Type: GEAR OIL LS 80W90
Job No: 8-375312

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT INC.1640 ENTERPRISE ROADMISSISSAUGA, ONCA  L4W 4L4Contact: Janice Crippsjcripps@strongco.comT: (905)565-3876F: (905)670-2338
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for visiblemetal particles in the oil. We advisethat you check all areas where dirtcan enter the system. Werecommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. An inspection forthe source(s) of wear may bewarranted at this time. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition. Re-samplingis suggested to confirm test resultsprior to significant maintenanceactivities being performed. Pleaseindicate that this is a resample onyour Sample Information Form (SIF).The fluid was not specified, however,a fluid match indicates that this fluidis (GENERIC) GEAR OIL LS 80W90. Please confirm.Iron ppm levels aresevere. PQ levels are severe. Highconcentration of visible metalpresent. Gear wear is indicated. Thevery high ferrous density (PQ) indexindicates that severe wear isoccurring. There is a moderateconcentration of dirt present in theoil. High amount of ingressed dirt hascaused abrasive wear to thecomponent. The oil is no longerserviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: SHEMISUnique No: 5620841Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 15 Aug 2023
Report Id: SHEMIS [WCAMIS] 02575790 (Generated: 08/15/2023 10:24:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Janice Cripps - SHEMIS

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP394510 --- --- ---Sample Date 11 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 4905 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 141 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 87 --- --- ---Sodium ppm <1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSPQ 13382 --- --- ---Iron ppm 3025 --- --- ---Copper ppm 13 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 4 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 7 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 3 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 18 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 41 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 22 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 23 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 915 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 66 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHEMIS [WCAMIS] 02575790 (Generated: 08/15/2023 10:24:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Janice Cripps - SHEMIS
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC350EL 314112\Rear Right Final Drive [VCP394510] 11 Aug 2023 @ 4905.0 hrs

