
[CAVANAGH [375072]] VOLVO EC380EL 314396 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP353461
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: 375072

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT54 IBER ROADOTTAWA, ONCA  K2S 1E8Contact: Daniel Simarddsimard@strongco.comT: (613)836-6633F: (613)836-2614
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. We advise thatyou check all areas where dirt canenter the system. The oil change atthe time of sampling has been noted.Confirm the source of the lubricantbeing utilized for top-up/fill. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Chromium andiron and titanium ppm levels areabnormal. Aluminum ppm levels arenoted. The low ferrous density (PQ)index indicates the wear metal levelsare due to corrosion. There is amoderate concentration of waterpresent in the oil. Elemental levels ofsilicon (Si) and aluminum (Al) indicatealumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress.High amount of ingressed dirt hascaused abrasive wear to thecomponent. Additive levels indicatethe addition of a different brand, ortype of oil. The oil is no longerserviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: SHESTIUnique No: 5629049Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 17 Aug 2023
Report Id: SHESTI [WCAMIS] 02575989 (Generated: 08/17/2023 10:17:19) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Daniel Simard - SHESTI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP353461 --- --- ---Sample Date 13 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 5173 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 145 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.492 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 3001 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 221 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 255 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSPQ 593 --- --- ---Iron ppm 3879 --- --- ---Copper ppm 8 --- --- ---Lead ppm 1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 783 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 47 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 6 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 47 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 32 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1090 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 217 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 159 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1663 --- --- ---Barium ppm 10 --- --- ---Boron ppm 71 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHESTI [WCAMIS] 02575989 (Generated: 08/17/2023 10:17:22) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Daniel Simard - SHESTI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC380EL 314396\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP353461] 13 Aug 2023 @ 5173.0 hrs

