
[[375374]] VOLVO A25F 80028 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP392465
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: 375374

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT54 IBER ROADOTTAWA, ONCA  K2S 1E8Contact: Daniel Simarddsimard@strongco.comT: (613)836-6633F: (613)836-2614
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.All componentwear rates are normal. There is amoderate amount of fuel present inthe oil. Tests confirm the presence offuel in the oil. Fuel is present in theoil and is lowering the viscosity. Theoil is no longer serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: SHESTIUnique No: 5629466Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 18 Aug 2023
Report Id: SHESTI [WCAMIS] 02576406 (Generated: 08/18/2023 11:39:05) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Daniel Simard - SHESTI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP392465 VCP352066 --- ---Sample Date 15 Aug 2023 06 Nov 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 16156 15482 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 60 --- --- ---Visc @ 100°C cSt 9.7 10.3 --- ---Viscosity Index (VI) Scale 145 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 85 61 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.1 0 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 76 72 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 65 58 --- ---Glycol % NEG NEG --- ---Fuel % 5.4 <1.0 --- ---Silicon ppm 8 6 --- ---Sodium ppm 3 2 --- ---Potassium ppm 1 1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 16 8 --- ---Copper ppm 2 1 --- ---Lead ppm <1 <1 --- ---Tin ppm <1 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 6 4 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 0 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 32 12 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm 16 67 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 <1 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1635 1682 --- ---Magnesium ppm 452 338 --- ---Zinc ppm 1060 1074 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 960 1014 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 46 106 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHESTI [WCAMIS] 02576406 (Generated: 08/18/2023 11:39:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Daniel Simard - SHESTI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25F 80028\Diesel Engine [VCP392465] 15 Aug 2023 @ 16156.0 hrs

