
[[375379]] VOLVO A25F 80028 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP392456
Oil Type: VOLVO AT 102
Job No: 375379

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT54 IBER ROADOTTAWA, ONCA  K2S 1E8Contact: Daniel Simarddsimard@strongco.comT: (613)836-6633F: (613)836-2614
Diagnosis
The fluid change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Confirmthe source of the lubricant beingutilized for top-up/fill. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Silver andcopper ppm levels are abnormal.Clutch disc wear or oil coolerleaching indicated. There is noindication of any contamination inthe fluid. Viscosity of sampleindicates oil is within SAE 30 range,advise investigate. This plus theadditive levels indicates that this isnot the same brand, or type of oil asreported. The fluid is no longerserviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: SHESTIUnique No: 5629539Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 18 Aug 2023
Report Id: SHESTI [WCAMIS] 02576479 (Generated: 08/18/2023 11:55:03) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Daniel Simard - SHESTI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP392456 --- --- ---Sample Date 15 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 16156 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 66.0 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 3 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 16 --- --- ---Copper ppm 278 --- --- ---Lead ppm 9 --- --- ---Tin ppm 9 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 6 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 6 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1629 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 10 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 638 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 650 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 40 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHESTI [WCAMIS] 02576479 (Generated: 08/18/2023 11:55:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Daniel Simard - SHESTI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25F 80028\Transmission (Auto) [VCP392456] 15 Aug 2023 @ 16156.0 hrs

