
[[375374]] VOLVO A25F 80028 - MIDDLE AXLE

Sample No: VCP392468
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: 375374

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT54 IBER ROADOTTAWA, ONCA  K2S 1E8Contact: Daniel Simarddsimard@strongco.comT: (613)836-6633F: (613)836-2614
Diagnosis
Confirm the source of the lubricantbeing utilized for top-up/fill.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. The fluid was specified asVOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90GL-5, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is SAE 40Transmission/Drive Train Oil.  Pleaseconfirm the oil type and grade onyour next sample.All component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. Viscosity of sample indicatesoil is within SAE 40 range, adviseinvestigate. This plus the additivelevels indicates that this is not thesame brand, or type of oil asreported. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: SHESTIUnique No: 5629564Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 18 Aug 2023
Report Id: SHESTI [WCAMIS] 02576504 (Generated: 08/18/2023 12:08:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Daniel Simard - SHESTI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP392468 --- --- ---Sample Date 15 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 16156 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 109 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 11 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 38 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2433 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 8 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 987 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 883 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 2 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHESTI [WCAMIS] 02576504 (Generated: 08/18/2023 12:08:13) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Daniel Simard - SHESTI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25F 80028\Middle Axle [VCP392468] 15 Aug 2023 @ 16156.0 hrs

