
[ROYAL BEDROCK] VOLVO L330E 62219 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP392461
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No:

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT54 IBER ROADOTTAWA, ONCA  K2S 1E8Contact: Andrew Mcleanamclean@strongco.comT: (613)836-6633F: (613)836-2614
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for visiblemetal particles in the oil. We advisethat you check all areas where dirtcan enter the system. Werecommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We recommendan early resample to monitor thiscondition. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.Copper ppm levels areabnormal. Aluminum ppm levels arenoted. Moderate concentration ofvisible metal present. Gear wear isindicated. Bearing and/or gear wearis indicated. Elemental levels ofsilicon (Si) and aluminum (Al) indicatealumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress.High amount of ingressed dirt hascaused abrasive wear to thecomponent. Viscosity of sampleindicates oil is within ISO 2 range,advise investigate. The oil is nolonger serviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: SHESTIUnique No: 5629567Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 18 Aug 2023
Report Id: SHESTI [WCAMIS] 02576507 (Generated: 08/29/2023 09:08:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Andrew Mclean - SHESTI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP392461 --- --- ---Sample Date 16 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 45.8 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 36 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 5 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 6 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 118 --- --- ---Copper ppm 56 --- --- ---Lead ppm 4 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 32 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2476 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 25 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 484 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 683 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 9 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHESTI [WCAMIS] 02576507 (Generated: 08/29/2023 09:08:40) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Andrew Mclean - SHESTI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L330E 62219\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP392461] 16 Aug 2023 @ .0 hrs

