
[ROYAL BEDROCK] VOLVO L330E 62219 - FRONT RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP380161
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No:

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT54 IBER ROADOTTAWA, ONCA  K2S 1E8Contact: Andrew Mcleanamclean@strongco.comT: (613)836-6633F: (613)836-2614
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Werecommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We recommendan early resample to monitor thiscondition. The fluid was not specified,however, a fluid match indicates thatthis fluid is SAE 75W80 Tractor TDHFluid.  Please confirm the oil type andgrade, and specify the brand of theoil on your next sample.Copper ppmlevels are abnormal. Aluminum ppmlevels are noted. Bearing and/orbushing wear is indicated. Elementallevels of silicon (Si) and aluminum(Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarsedirt) ingress. High amount ofingressed dirt has caused abrasivewear to the component. The oil is nolonger serviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: SHESTIUnique No: 5629568Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 18 Aug 2023
Report Id: SHESTI [WCAMIS] 02576508 (Generated: 08/29/2023 09:08:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Andrew Mclean - SHESTI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP380161 --- --- ---Sample Date 16 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 46.0 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 56 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 7 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 10 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 139 --- --- ---Copper ppm 56 --- --- ---Lead ppm 4 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 39 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2530 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 38 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 499 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 683 --- --- ---Barium ppm 1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 9 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHESTI [WCAMIS] 02576508 (Generated: 08/29/2023 09:08:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Andrew Mclean - SHESTI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L330E 62219\Front Right Final Drive [VCP380161] 16 Aug 2023 @ .0 hrs

