
[[374735]] VOLVO L70H 622160 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP394706
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 374735

STRONGCO EQUIP (AB)6 - 38403 BURNT LAKE TRAILRED DEER COUNTY, ABCA  T4S 2L4Contact: Perry Doylepdoyle@strongco.comT: (403)346-3473F: (403)346-3487
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO9652Unique No: 5629727Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 18 Aug 2023
Report Id: VOLVO9652 [WCAMIS] 02576667 (Generated: 08/18/2023 14:24:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Perry Doyle - VOLVO9652

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP394706 VCP392392 VCP352960 VCP332545Sample Date 14 Aug 2023 06 Apr 2023 03 Nov 2022 22 Jun 2022Machine Hours 7123 6501 5863 5306Oil Hours 600 0 500 700Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.9 13.9 13.7 13.1Oxidation (PA) % 88 96 102 92
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.2 0 0 0Nitration (PA) % 73 85 85 75Sulfation (PA) % 66 73 69 70Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 5 7 6 7Sodium ppm 3 2 3 3Potassium ppm 0 0 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 9 10 10 10Copper ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 0Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 3 5 5 5Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 45 47 44 42Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 <1Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1676 1879 1784 1707Magnesium ppm 608 578 532 533Zinc ppm 1151 1203 1143 1142Phosphorus ppm 1029 1090 1007 968Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 20 32 28 33

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO9652 [WCAMIS] 02576667 (Generated: 08/18/2023 14:24:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Perry Doyle - VOLVO9652
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L70H 622160\Diesel Engine [VCP394706] 14 Aug 2023 @ 7123.0 hrs

