
[[8000374907]] VOLVO EC300DL 210165 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP379591
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 8000374907

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT255 BAIG BOULEVARDMONCTON, NBCA  E1E 1E1Contact: Greg Wardgward@strongco.comT: (506)857-8425F: (506)857-0851
Diagnosis
Check for low coolant level. The oilchange at the time of sampling hasbeen noted. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. Water treatmentchemicals present, indicating slowcoolant leak. Test for glycol isnegative. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service (seerecommendation).

Depot: SHE255MONUnique No: 5630725Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 23 Aug 2023
Report Id: SHE255MON [WCAMIS] 02577665 (Generated: 08/30/2023 07:25:26) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Greg Ward - SHE255MON

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP379591 WC0728161 WC0676172 WC0620474Sample Date 14 Aug 2023 06 Oct 2022 20 Apr 2022 26 Jan 2022Machine Hours 15866 14836 14368 13913Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ATTENTION ATTENTION ATTENTION NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 14.0 13.5 13.4 13.5Oxidation (PA) % 83 87 49 86
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.9 0.5 0.1 0.5Nitration (PA) % 81 83 50 72Sulfation (PA) % 79 73 54 70Glycol % 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0Fuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 8 9 8 11Sodium ppm 349 869 660 101Potassium ppm 4 10 10 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 57 31 16 16Copper ppm 10 2 1 1Lead ppm 5 <1 <1 <1Tin ppm 3 2 1 2Aluminum ppm 6 4 5 5Chromium ppm 5 2 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 39 41 34 40Nickel ppm 5 <1 <1 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1769 1774 1723 1766Magnesium ppm 485 500 445 535Zinc ppm 1142 1109 1065 1106Phosphorus ppm 984 1028 962 963Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 25 24 29 28

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHE255MON [WCAMIS] 02577665 (Generated: 08/30/2023 07:25:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Greg Ward - SHE255MON
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC300DL 210165\Diesel Engine [VCP379591] 14 Aug 2023 @ 15866.0 hrs

