
VOLVO L180H 5344 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP381345
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No:

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT5200 BOUL ST JOSEPHTROIS RIVIERE, QCCA  G8Z 4L8Contact: Alain Gauthieragauthier@strongco.comT: F: (819)840-0829
Diagnosis
Échantillonner de nouveaul`équipement au prochain intervallede vidange afin d`en surveiller lacondition.Les taux d`usure de tous lescomposants sont normaux. Elevatedaluminum (Al) and/or lead (Pb) andpotassium (K) levels in your metalsanalysis are likely a result of solderflux release into the lubricant and iscommon on newequipment/components. Il n`y aaucun indice de contamination dansl`huile. L`état de l`huile est acceptablepour la durée de service.

Depot: STR520TROUnique No: 5630759Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 23 Aug 2023
Report Id: STR520TRO [WCAMIS] 02577699 (Generated: 09/19/2023 16:44:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Alain Gauthier - STR520TRO

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP381345 --- --- ---Sample Date 13 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1990 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.8 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 45 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 54 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 50 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 5 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 5 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 9 --- --- ---Copper ppm 21 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 4 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 22 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2048 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 119 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1004 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 918 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 45 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: STR520TRO [WCAMIS] 02577699 (Generated: 09/19/2023 16:44:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Alain Gauthier - STR520TRO
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L180H 5344\Diesel Engine [VCP381345] 13 Aug 2023 @ 1990.0 hrs

