
[REGION OF PEEL [8-375956]] VOLVO L60H 622566 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP391574
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 40
Job No: 8-375956

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT INC.1640 ENTERPRISE ROADMISSISSAUGA, ONCA  L4W 4L4Contact: Janice Crippsjcripps@strongco.comT: (905)565-3876F: (905)670-2338
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition. The fluid wasnot specified, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is (GENERIC)DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 40.  Pleaseconfirm.Aluminum ppm levels areabnormal. Piston wear is indicated.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The oil is nolonger serviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: SHEMISUnique No: 5631469Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 25 Aug 2023
Report Id: SHEMIS [WCAMIS] 02578409 (Generated: 08/25/2023 13:52:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Janice Cripps - SHEMIS

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP391574 VCP352385 --- ---Sample Date 23 Aug 2023 22 Sep 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 986 517 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.8 12.4 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 73 76 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.4 0.1 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 75 63 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 63 63 --- ---Glycol % NEG NEG --- ---Fuel % <1.0 <1.0 --- ---Silicon ppm 16 14 --- ---Sodium ppm 5 4 --- ---Potassium ppm 2 2 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 55 33 --- ---Copper ppm 11 7 --- ---Lead ppm <1 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 3 2 --- ---Aluminum ppm 52 44 --- ---Chromium ppm 10 8 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 38 39 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 4 4 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1614 1580 --- ---Magnesium ppm 551 573 --- ---Zinc ppm 1120 1090 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1014 1021 --- ---Barium ppm 2 <1 --- ---Boron ppm 34 51 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHEMIS [WCAMIS] 02578409 (Generated: 08/25/2023 13:52:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Janice Cripps - SHEMIS
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L60H 622566\Diesel Engine [VCP391574] 23 Aug 2023 @ 986.0 hrs

