
VOLVO EW210D 27094 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP201411
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 32
Job No:

CITY OF REGINA - FLEET SERVICES DEPT2476 VICTORIA AVENUE, BOX 1790REGINA, SKCA  S4P 3C8Contact: Curtis Jorscjors@regina.caT: (306)777-7674F: (306)777-6813
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. The system cleanliness isacceptable for your target ISO 4406cleanliness code. The system andfluid cleanliness is acceptable. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: CITREGUnique No: 5632564Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 31 Aug 2023
Report Id: CITREG [WCAMIS] 02579504 (Generated: 08/31/2023 08:40:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Curtis Jors - CITREG

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP201411 VCE65518 VCE65519 VCE446309Sample Date 15 May 2023 31 Oct 2022 31 Oct 2022 12 Feb 2022Machine Hours 4631 3798 3798 2814Oil Hours 0 0 0 2814Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 38.4 38.6 38.3 32.9
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 832 15735 3768 26542Particles >6µm 206 3679 425 5067Particles >14µm 17 215 6 385ISO 4406:1999 (c) 17/15/11 21/19/15 19/16/10 22/20/16Silicon ppm 4 4 4 3Sodium ppm 1 1 1 1Potassium ppm 1 <1 <1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 2 2 2 8Copper ppm 6 8 7 2Lead ppm <1 1 1 2Tin ppm 0 0 0 0Aluminum ppm <1 <1 <1 2Chromium ppm <1 0 0 0Molybdenum ppm <1 0 <1 <1Nickel ppm 0 <1 0 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 0 0 0 0Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 93 115 116 85Magnesium ppm 1 <1 <1 4Zinc ppm 598 635 629 273Phosphorus ppm 486 552 554 332Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm <1 <1 <1 48

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CITREG [WCAMIS] 02579504 (Generated: 08/31/2023 08:40:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Curtis Jors - CITREG
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EW210D 27094\Hydraulic System [VCP201411] 15 May 2023 @ 4631.0 hrs

