
[RSM [376667]] VOLVO A30G 752845 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP392419
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 376667

STRONGCO INC1575  RUE BERSIMISCHICOUTIMI, QCCA  G7K 1G9Contact: Mario Tremblaymtremblay@strongco.comT: (418)690-1724F: (418)690-5002
Diagnosis
Aucune mesure corrective n`estrecommandée pour l`instant.Échantillonner de nouveaul`équipement au prochain intervallede vidange afin d`en surveiller lacondition.Les taux de métaux sonttypiques pour la période de rodaged`un nouveau composant. La teneuren carburant est négligeable.Elevated aluminum (Al) and/or lead(Pb) and potassium (K) levels in yourmetals analysis are likely a result ofsolder flux release into the lubricantand is common on newequipment/components. Il n`y aaucun indice de contamination dansl`huile. La viscosité de l’échantillon sesitue dans la portée de l’SAE 30; nousvous conseillons de vérifier. L`état del`huile est acceptable pour la duréede service.

Depot: VOLVO0230Unique No: 5633703Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 07 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0230 [WCAMIS] 02580643 (Generated: 09/28/2023 15:22:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Mario Tremblay - VOLVO0230

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP392419 --- --- ---Sample Date 01 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 592 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 10.5 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 60 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.3 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 80 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 59 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 0.6 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 37 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 4 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 4 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 33 --- --- ---Copper ppm 346 --- --- ---Lead ppm 10 --- --- ---Tin ppm 4 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 83 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 2 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 4 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2194 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 11 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1126 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 995 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 26 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0230 [WCAMIS] 02580643 (Generated: 09/28/2023 15:22:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Mario Tremblay - VOLVO0230
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30G 752845\Diesel Engine [VCP392419] 01 Sep 2023 @ 592.0 hrs

