
VOLVO L45G 220049 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP336010
Oil Type: CONVENTIONAL COOLANT
Job No:

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT--CALGARY7923 54TH STREET SECALGARY, ABCA  T2C 4R7Contact: MAH COXMCOX@STRONGCO.COMT: (403)216-1010F: (403)216-1016
Diagnosis
We recommend drain system, andrefill with 50/50 antifreeze watermixture. We advise that you replenishthe supplemental coolant additives(SCAs) and add per manufacturer`sspecifications. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition.Aluminum and iron ppmlevels are abnormal. The iron level ishigh indicating rust in the systemwhich clogs the cooling system. Thehigh metal levels indicate corrosionin the system. There is no indicationof any contamination in thecomponent(unconfirmed). Thereserve alkalinity of this fluid is lowerthan acceptable. The coolant iscloudy indicating either anoverconcentration of coolantadditives, or a mixing of incompatiblecoolant technologies. The low nitritelevel indicates reduced cavitationprotection which leads to corrosionand ammonia formation. The pH islow which causes rust formation.

Depot: VOLVO3909Unique No: 5643410Signed: Bill QuesnelReport Date: 18 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO3909 [WCAMIS] 02582345 (Generated: 09/18/2023 16:55:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MAH COX - VOLVO3909

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP336010 --- --- ---Sample Date 02 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1675 --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONBoron ppm 14 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 17 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3378 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 922 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 32 --- --- ---pH Scale 0-14 7.06 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 2.3 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 37 --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 280 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 44.5 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -21 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONMagnesium ppm 4 --- --- ---Calcium ppm 16 --- --- ---Coolant Appearance Cloudy --- --- ---Coolant Color Other --- --- ---Sand/Dirt scalar NONE --- --- ---Debris scalar NONE --- --- ---Precipitate scalar NONE --- --- ---Silt scalar LIGHT --- --- ---
 CORROSIONIron ppm 48 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 75 --- --- ---Copper ppm 0 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO3909 [WCAMIS] 02582345 (Generated: 09/18/2023 16:55:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MAH COX - VOLVO3909
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L45G 220049\Coolant [VCP336010] 02 Sep 2023 @ 1675.0 hrs

