
[GFL [8-377629]] VOLVO L120H 632507 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP429964
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: 8-377629

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT INC.1640 ENTERPRISE ROADMISSISSAUGA, ONCA  L4W 4L4Contact: Janice Crippsjcripps@strongco.comT: (905)565-3876F: (905)670-2338
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.All component wearrates are normal. The systemcleanliness is acceptable for yourtarget ISO 4406 cleanliness code. Thesystem and fluid cleanliness isacceptable. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: SHEMISUnique No: 5643938Signed: Bill QuesnelReport Date: 18 Sep 2023
Report Id: SHEMIS [WCAMIS] 02582873 (Generated: 09/18/2023 18:30:41) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Janice Cripps - SHEMIS

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP429964 --- --- ---Sample Date 08 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 17100 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 36.3 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 2045 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 276 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 22 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 18/15/12 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 4 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 4 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 9 --- --- ---Copper ppm 1 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 131 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 3 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 443 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 374 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 5 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHEMIS [WCAMIS] 02582873 (Generated: 09/18/2023 18:30:44) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Janice Cripps - SHEMIS
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L120H 632507\Hydraulic System [VCP429964] 08 Sep 2023 @ 17100.0 hrs

