
[[374949]] VOLVO L60F 61944 - TRANSMISSION (MANUAL)

Sample No: VCP394748
Oil Type: VOLVO AT 102
Job No: 374949

STRONGCO EQUIP (AB)6 - 38403 BURNT LAKE TRAILRED DEER COUNTY, ABCA  T4S 2L4Contact: Perry Doylepdoyle@strongco.comT: (403)346-3473F: (403)346-3487
Diagnosis
Confirm the source of the lubricantbeing utilized for top-up/fill.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. The fluid was specified asVOLVO AT 102, however, a fluidmatch indicates that this fluid is SAE70W80 Tractor TDH Fluid.  Pleaseconfirm the fluid type and grade onyour next sample.All component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe fluid. Additive levels indicate theaddition of a different brand, or typeof fluid. The condition of the fluid isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO9652Unique No: 5643946Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 15 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO9652 [WCAMIS] 02582881 (Generated: 09/15/2023 15:28:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Perry Doyle - VOLVO9652

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP394748 VCE241545 VCE038159 ---Sample Date 13 Sep 2023 25 Apr 2016 16 Dec 2009 ---Machine Hours 7872 3658 146 ---Oil Hours 4000 0 156 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Not Changd ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 35.2 44.1 28.7 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 9 7 18 ---Sodium ppm 4 4 11 ---Potassium ppm 1 2 15 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 14 41 53 ---Copper ppm 3 2 4 ---Lead ppm 2 3 21 ---Tin ppm 0 <1 5 ---Aluminum ppm 6 15 3 ---Chromium ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm 2 46 <1 ---Nickel ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 0 ---Silver ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 7 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2291 1343 66 ---Magnesium ppm 16 203 2 ---Zinc ppm 897 810 260 ---Phosphorus ppm 847 730 168 ---Barium ppm 0 <1 6 ---Boron ppm 107 183 32 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO9652 [WCAMIS] 02582881 (Generated: 09/15/2023 15:28:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Perry Doyle - VOLVO9652
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L60F 61944\Transmission (Manual) [VCP394748] 13 Sep 2023 @ 7872.0 hrs

