
[[8000378801]] VOLVO L30GS 3224376 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP394657
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 8000378801

STRONGCO EQUIP (AB)6 - 38403 BURNT LAKE TRAILRED DEER COUNTY, ABCA  T4S 2L4Contact: Perry Doylepdoyle@strongco.comT: (403)346-3473F: (403)346-3487
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the airfilter, air induction system, and anyareas where dirt may enter thecomponent. We recommend that youdrain the oil from the component ifthis has not already been done. Oiland filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Copper ppmlevels are abnormal. Aluminum ppmlevels are noted. Bearing wear isindicated. Elemental levels of silicon(Si) and aluminum (Al) indicatealumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress.High amount of ingressed dirt hascaused abrasive wear to thecomponent. The oil is no longerserviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: VOLVO9652Unique No: 5644124Signed: Bill QuesnelReport Date: 18 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO9652 [WCAMIS] 02583059 (Generated: 09/18/2023 16:22:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Perry Doyle - VOLVO9652

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP394657 VCP332598 VCP334120 VCP280637Sample Date 15 Sep 2023 26 Jul 2022 21 Jan 2022 13 Mar 2021Machine Hours 4682 2994 2193 1471Oil Hours 0 780 2193 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 15.1 15.4 14.9 14.5Oxidation (PA) % 114 139 135 131
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.2 0 0 0Nitration (PA) % 131 125 121 115Sulfation (PA) % 72 76 74 73Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 34 6 8 8Sodium ppm 6 4 4 6Potassium ppm 2 <1 <1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 50 14 14 18Copper ppm 17 <1 <1 1Lead ppm <1 0 0 0Tin ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 13 2 2 2Chromium ppm 4 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 43 42 43 38Nickel ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1722 1705 1660 1634Magnesium ppm 521 515 531 517Zinc ppm 1117 1153 1129 910Phosphorus ppm 980 929 958 721Barium ppm 0 0 0 <1Boron ppm 40 49 44 45

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO9652 [WCAMIS] 02583059 (Generated: 09/18/2023 16:22:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Perry Doyle - VOLVO9652
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L30GS 3224376\Diesel Engine [VCP394657] 15 Sep 2023 @ 4682.0 hrs

