
[MADA HOLDINGS [8-379612]] VOLVO A30F 82138 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP392268
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 40
Job No: 8-379612

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT INC.1640 ENTERPRISE ROADMISSISSAUGA, ONCA  L4W 4L4Contact: Jason RothJRoth2@strongco.comT: (905)670-5100F: (905)670-2338
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of the coolant leak. Werecommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We advise thatyou flush the component thoroughlybefore re-filling with oil. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition. The fluid wasnot specified, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is (GENERIC)DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 40.  Pleaseconfirm.All component wear rates arenormal. Test for glycol is positive.There is a light concentration ofglycol present in the oil. The oil is nolonger serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: SHEMISUnique No: 5646201Signed: Bill QuesnelReport Date: 26 Sep 2023
Report Id: SHEMIS [WCAMIS] 02585136 (Generated: 09/26/2023 17:16:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jason Roth - SHEMIS

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP392268 --- --- ---Sample Date 25 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 8524 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 14.1 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 64 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 45 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 57 --- --- ---Glycol % 0.023 --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 5 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 12 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 3 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2079 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 13 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1086 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 958 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 165 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHEMIS [WCAMIS] 02585136 (Generated: 09/26/2023 17:16:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jason Roth - SHEMIS
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30F 82138\Diesel Engine [VCP392268] 25 Sep 2023 @ 8524.0 hrs

