
[J. WILK LANDSCAPING] VOLVO L90H 624956 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP352110
Oil Type: VOLVO AT 102
Job No:

REDHEAD EQUIPMENTBOX 32098, HIGHWAY #1 EASTREGINA, SKCA  S4N 7L2Contact: Jamie Jonesjamie.jones@redheadequipment.caT: (306)721-5555F: (306)721-2855
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Weadvise that you check for visiblemetal particles in the fluid. Werecommend that you drain the fluidfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We recommendan early resample to monitor thiscondition.Iron ppm levels areabnormal. Light concentration ofvisible metal present. Gear wear isindicated. The low ferrous density(PQ) index indicates the wear metallevels are due to corrosion. Lightconcentration of visible dirt/debrispresent in the fluid. The fluid is nolonger serviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: RED105REGUnique No: 5655879Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 06 Oct 2023
Report Id: RED105REG [WCAMIS] 02586813 (Generated: 10/06/2023 14:24:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jamie Jones - RED105REG

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP352110 --- --- ---Sample Date 27 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3560 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 26.9 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 15 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 7 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSPQ 11 --- --- ---Iron ppm 175 --- --- ---Copper ppm 20 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 10 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 11 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 202 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 2 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 68 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 191 --- --- ---Barium ppm 3 --- --- ---Boron ppm 46 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: RED105REG [WCAMIS] 02586813 (Generated: 10/06/2023 14:24:03) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jamie Jones - RED105REG
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 624956\Transmission (Auto) [VCP352110] 27 Sep 2023 @ 3560.0 hrs

