
[[380667]] 16-8002 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP429737
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: 380667

CRH CANADA GROUP INC.P.O. BOX 5400CONCORD, ONCA  L4K 1B6Contact: Dan Browndan.brown@ca.crh.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. The system cleanliness isacceptable for your target ISO 4406cleanliness code. The system andfluid cleanliness is acceptable. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: HOLCONUnique No: 5657711Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 13 Oct 2023
Report Id: HOLCON [WCAMIS] 02588645 (Generated: 10/13/2023 16:35:39) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Dan Brown - HOLCON

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP429737 VCP394899 VCP352929 VCE225503Sample Date 06 Oct 2023 21 May 2023 25 Sep 2022 03 Feb 2016Machine Hours 18004 16959 16000 4871Oil Hours 2000 1000 4000 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 41.6 42.6 41.0 40.2
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 11083 3928 1391 12787Particles >6µm 2446 866 289 2540Particles >14µm 67 49 12 99ISO 4406:1999 (c) 21/18/13 19/17/13 18/15/11 21/19/14Silicon ppm 4 3 4 3Sodium ppm 2 1 3 <1Potassium ppm 0 <1 <1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 7 4 6 2Copper ppm 2 1 2 1Lead ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Tin ppm 0 0 0 <1Aluminum ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 0Molybdenum ppm 0 0 0 0Nickel ppm <1 0 <1 0Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 0Silver ppm <1 0 0 0Manganese ppm 0 0 0 0Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 80 83 67 56Magnesium ppm 1 1 2 <1Zinc ppm 445 436 418 461Phosphorus ppm 344 376 370 355Barium ppm <1 0 0 0Boron ppm <1 <1 <1 0

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: HOLCON [WCAMIS] 02588645 (Generated: 10/13/2023 16:35:42) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Dan Brown - HOLCON
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO 16-8002\Hydraulic System [VCP429737] 06 Oct 2023 @ 18004.0 hrs

