
[[381461]] VOLVO G940 41225 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP353348
Oil Type: VOLVO AT 102
Job No: 381461

VILLE DE ST-RAYMOND375 RUE ST-JOSEPHST RAYMOND, QCCA  G3L 1A1Contact: 
T: F: (418)337-2203
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Werecommend that you drain the fluidfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We recommendan early resample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a moderateconcentration of water present in thefluid. Test for glycol is negative. Thefluid is no longer serviceable due tothe presence of contaminants.

Depot: VILSTRUnique No: 5658749Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 18 Oct 2023
Report Id: VILSTR [WCAMIS] 02589683 (Generated: 10/18/2023 14:34:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ? ? - VILSTR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP353348 --- --- ---Sample Date 11 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 12371 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 30.7 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.772 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 6 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 14 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 11 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 58 --- --- ---Copper ppm 3 --- --- ---Lead ppm 8 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 159 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 15 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 143 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 272 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 83 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VILSTR [WCAMIS] 02589683 (Generated: 10/18/2023 14:34:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ? ? - VILSTR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO G940 41225\Transmission (Auto) [VCP353348] 11 Oct 2023 @ 12371.0 hrs

