
VOLVO A30F 82030 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP380225
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80
Job No:

CONQUEST EQUIPMENTPO BOX 1188ESTEVAN, SKCA  S4A 2H8Contact: Service Managersales@conquestequipment.caT: (888)724-7404F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Viscosityof sample indicates oil is within SAE75W80 range, advise investigate. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: CONESTUnique No: 5658811Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 18 Oct 2023
Report Id: CONEST [WCAMIS] 02589745 (Generated: 10/18/2023 11:17:28) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - CONEST

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP380225 VCP145524 --- ---Sample Date 18 Sep 2023 08 May 2013 --- ---Machine Hours 10249 1044 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed N/A N/A --- ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 51.1 67.2 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 38 4 --- ---Sodium ppm 4 0 --- ---Potassium ppm 2 2 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 209 163 --- ---Copper ppm 5 6 --- ---Lead ppm <1 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 0 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 9 <1 --- ---Chromium ppm 3 6 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 1 2 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 3 --- ---Silver ppm <1 <1 --- ---Manganese ppm 2 14 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 <1 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 226 37 --- ---Magnesium ppm 4 2 --- ---Zinc ppm 93 10 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 2414 1453 --- ---Barium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Boron ppm 243 176 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CONEST [WCAMIS] 02589745 (Generated: 10/18/2023 11:17:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - CONEST
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30F 82030\Rear Axle [VCP380225] 18 Sep 2023 @ 10249.0 hrs

