
[HAMMEL GENERAL CONTRACTING [439707]] VOLVO A30E 72116 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCE177134
Oil Type: SAE 10W40
Job No: 439707

REDHEAD EQUIPMENTBOX 32098, HIGHWAY #1 EASTREGINA, SKCA  S4N 7L2Contact: WADE SANDOFFwade.sandoff@redheadequipment.caT: (306)790-3431F: 307903466
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Fuel content negligible. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. Viscosity of sample indicatesoil is within SAE 30 range, adviseinvestigate. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: RED705REGUnique No: 5671623Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 08 Nov 2023
Report Id: RED705REG [WCAMIS] 02594544 (Generated: 11/08/2023 17:26:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: WADE SANDOFF - RED705REG

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCE177134 VC537793 --- ---Sample Date 27 Oct 2023 14 May 2010 --- ---Machine Hours 10046 3040 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.2 10.5 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 58 43 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0 0.1 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 44 42 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 48 47 --- ---Glycol % NEG NEG --- ---Fuel % 0.9 0.0 --- ---Silicon ppm 4 5 --- ---Sodium ppm 8 2 --- ---Potassium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 11 6 --- ---Copper ppm 4 1 --- ---Lead ppm <1 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 0 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 1 --- ---Chromium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 58 1 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Silver ppm <1 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 0 <1 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1011 2510 --- ---Magnesium ppm 907 8 --- ---Zinc ppm 1146 1176 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 970 1000 --- ---Barium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Boron ppm 1 2 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: RED705REG [WCAMIS] 02594544 (Generated: 11/08/2023 17:26:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: WADE SANDOFF - RED705REG
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30E 72116\Diesel Engine [VCE177134] 27 Oct 2023 @ 10046.0 hrs

