
[MCBM [383463]] VOLVO EC460C 110170 - RIGHT SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP353055
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: 383463

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT INC.72 CHEMIN DU TREMBLAYBOUCHERVILLE, QCCA  J4B 6Z6Contact: Jonathan Jobinjjobin@strongco.comT: F: (450)449-7913
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. The fluid was notspecified, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is SAE 50 GearOil.  Please confirm the oil type andgrade, and specify the brand of theoil on your next sample.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.The water content is negligible. Thereis no indication of any contaminationin the oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: SHEBOUUnique No: 5671757Signed: Bill QuesnelReport Date: 10 Nov 2023
Report Id: SHEBOU [WCAMIS] 02594678 (Generated: 11/23/2023 09:16:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jonathan Jobin - SHEBOU

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP353055 --- --- ---Sample Date 01 Nov 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 4181 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 153 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.00 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 19 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 306 --- --- ---Copper ppm 31 --- --- ---Lead ppm 2 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 5 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 4 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 5 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 17 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 17 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 32 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1174 --- --- ---Barium ppm 3 --- --- ---Boron ppm 37 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHEBOU [WCAMIS] 02594678 (Generated: 11/23/2023 09:16:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jonathan Jobin - SHEBOU
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC460C 110170\Right Swing Drive [VCP353055] 01 Nov 2023 @ 4181.0 hrs

