
[HAMMEL GENERAL CONTRACTING [439707]] VOLVO A30E 72116 - BOGIE/CENTER LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP132645
Oil Type: SAE 80W90
Job No: 439707

REDHEAD EQUIPMENTBOX 32098, HIGHWAY #1 EASTREGINA, SKCA  S4N 7L2Contact: John EdgerJohn.Edger@redheadequipment.caT: (306)721-5555F: (306)721-2855
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: RED705REGUnique No: 5671763Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 07 Nov 2023
Report Id: RED705REG [WCAMIS] 02594684 (Generated: 11/07/2023 17:12:26) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: John Edger - RED705REG

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP132645 --- --- ---Sample Date 27 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 10046 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 88.6 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 29 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 12 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 128 --- --- ---Copper ppm 23 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 4 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 48 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 4 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 20 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1183 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 306 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: RED705REG [WCAMIS] 02594684 (Generated: 11/07/2023 17:12:28) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: John Edger - RED705REG
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30E 72116\Bogie/Center Left Final Drive [VCP132645] 27 Oct 2023 @ 10046.0 hrs

