
[IDL [3705]] 352488 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP314315
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: 3705

Great West Equipment3830 Sharples RoadTerrace, BCCA  V8G 5P8Contact: Justin Waitejwaite@gwequipment.comT: (250)635-9033F: (250)638-1895
Diagnosis
We recommend that you drain thefluid from the component if this hasnot already been done. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition. Please specifythe brand, type, and viscosity of theoil on your next sample.PQ levels areabnormal. Iron and nickel ppm levelsare abnormal. Gear wear is indicated.The high ferrous density (PQ) indexindicates that abnormal wear isoccurring. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fluid. Thefluid is no longer serviceable as aresult of the abnormal and/or severewear.

Depot: VOLVO0284Unique No: 5681965Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 17 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0284 [WCAMIS] 02596885 (Generated: 11/17/2023 10:36:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Justin Waite - VOLVO0284

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP314315 --- --- ---Sample Date 09 Nov 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3665 --- --- ---Oil Hours 640 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 28.1 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 19 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 4 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSPQ 98 --- --- ---Iron ppm 160 --- --- ---Copper ppm 33 --- --- ---Lead ppm 1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 3 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 6 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 6 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 85 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 3 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 74 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 163 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 43 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0284 [WCAMIS] 02596885 (Generated: 11/17/2023 10:36:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Justin Waite - VOLVO0284
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO 352488\Transmission (Auto) [VCP314315] 09 Nov 2023 @ 3665.0 hrs

