
[LAFARGE [386095]] VOLVO L220H 386095 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP333949
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 386095

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT--CALGARY7923 54TH STREET SECALGARY, ABCA  T2C 4R7Contact: MAH COXMCOX@STRONGCO.COMT: (403)216-1010F: (403)216-1016
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the airfilter, air induction system, and anyareas where dirt may enter thecomponent. We advise that youmonitor for an abnormal oil pressuredrop and noise. We recommend thatyou drain the oil from the componentif this has not already been done. Weadvise that you flush the componentthoroughly before re-filling with oil.We recommend you service the filterson this component. We recommendan early resample to monitor thiscondition.Tin ppm levels are severe.PQ levels are abnormal. Iron and leadppm levels are abnormal. Aluminumppm levels are noted. Cylinder, crank,or cam shaft wear is indicated.Bearing wear is indicated. Slidebearing wear is indicated. The highferrous density (PQ) index indicatesthat abnormal wear is occurring. Fuelcontent negligible. Elemental levelsof silicon (Si) and aluminum (Al)indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt)ingress. High amount of ingresseddirt has caused abrasive wear to thecomponent. The oil is no longerserviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: VOLVO3909Unique No: 5683198Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 24 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO3909 [WCAMIS] 02598118 (Generated: 11/24/2023 09:21:39) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MAH COX - VOLVO3909

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP333949 --- --- ---Sample Date 21 Nov 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3889 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.7 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 82 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 51 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 65 --- --- ---Glycol % 0.0 --- --- ---Fuel % 0.9 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 95 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 4 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 5 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 156 --- --- ---Copper ppm 36 --- --- ---Lead ppm 32 --- --- ---Tin ppm 31 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 32 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 3 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 39 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 5 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 3 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1783 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 513 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1039 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 888 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 43 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO3909 [WCAMIS] 02598118 (Generated: 11/24/2023 09:21:41) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MAH COX - VOLVO3909
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L220H 386095\Diesel Engine [VCP333949] 21 Nov 2023 @ 3889.0 hrs

